
[∼118H2624] 

[DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
119TH CONGRESS 

1ST SESSION H. R. ll 

To update the definition of an emerging growth company, and for other 

purposes. 

IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 

Mr. STEIL introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee 

on lllllllllllllll 

A BILL 
To update the definition of an emerging growth company, 

and for other purposes. 

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-1

tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 2

SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE. 3

This Act may be cited as the ‘‘Helping Startups Con-4

tinue To Grow Act’’. 5

SEC. 2. EMERGING GROWTH COMPANY CRITERIA. 6

(a) SECURITIES ACT OF 1933.—Section 2(a)(19) of 7

the Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77b(a)(19)) is 8

amended— 9

VerDate Nov 24 2008 16:36 Feb 20, 2025 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00001 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\MMCROTTY\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\118H[262
February 20, 2025 (4:36 p.m.)

G:\CMTE\FS\19\SEC\MAJORITY\118H[2624].XML

g:\V\E\022025\E022025.108.xml           (968637|3)



2 

(1) by striking ‘‘$1,000,000,000’’ each place 1

such term appears and inserting ‘‘$3,000,000,000’’; 2

(2) in subparagraph (B)— 3

(A) by striking ‘‘fifth’’ and inserting ‘‘10- 4

year’’; and 5

(B) by adding ‘‘or’’ at the end; 6

(3) in subparagraph (C), by striking ‘‘; or’’ and 7

inserting a period; and 8

(4) by striking subparagraph (D). 9

(b) SECURITIES EXCHANGE ACT OF 1934.—Section 10

3(a) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 11

78c(a)) is amended, in the first paragraph (80)— 12

(1) by striking ‘‘$1,000,000,000’’ each place 13

such term appears and inserting ‘‘$3,000,000,000’’; 14

(2) in subparagraph (B)— 15

(A) by striking ‘‘fifth’’ and inserting ‘‘10- 16

year’’; and 17

(B) by adding ‘‘or’’ at the end; 18

(3) in subparagraph (C), by striking ‘‘; or’’ and 19

inserting a period; and 20

(4) by striking subparagraph (D). 21

VerDate Nov 24 2008 16:36 Feb 20, 2025 Jkt 000000 PO 00000 Frm 00002 Fmt 6652 Sfmt 6201 C:\USERS\MMCROTTY\APPDATA\ROAMING\SOFTQUAD\XMETAL\11.0\GEN\C\118H[262
February 20, 2025 (4:36 p.m.)

G:\CMTE\FS\19\SEC\MAJORITY\118H[2624].XML

g:\V\E\022025\E022025.108.xml           (968637|3)



[DISCUSSION DRAFT]


		119th CONGRESS
1st Session





		



		





H. R. __

To update the definition of an emerging growth company, and for other purposes.




IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES

Mr. Steil introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on _______________




A BILL

To update the definition of an emerging growth company, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representatives of the United States of America in Congress assembled, 

SECTION 1. Short title.

This Act may be cited as the “Helping Startups Continue To Grow Act”.


SEC. 2. Emerging growth company criteria.

(a) Securities Act of 1933.—Section 2(a)(19) of the Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77b(a)(19)) is amended— 


(1) by striking “$1,000,000,000” each place such term appears and inserting “$3,000,000,000”;


(2) in subparagraph (B)— 


(A) by striking “fifth” and inserting “10-year”; and


(B) by adding “or” at the end; 


(3) in subparagraph (C), by striking “; or” and inserting a period; and


(4) by striking subparagraph (D).


(b) Securities Exchange Act of 1934.—Section 3(a) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78c(a)) is amended, in the first paragraph (80)— 


(1) by striking “$1,000,000,000” each place such term appears and inserting “$3,000,000,000”;


(2) in subparagraph (B)— 


(A) by striking “fifth” and inserting “10-year”; and


(B) by adding “or” at the end; 


(3) in subparagraph (C), by striking “; or” and inserting a period; and


(4) by striking subparagraph (D).






  
    G:\CMTE\FS\19\SEC\MAJORITY\118H[2624].XML XXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 2/20/2025 16:36 XXXXXXXXX 02/04/2025 4:29 PM  XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXXX XXXXXXXX 
  968637|3
  
  
 [Discussion Draft] 
   [~118H2624] 
 (Original Signature of Member) 
 [DISCUSSION DRAFT] 
  
  
 
  
 I 
 119th CONGRESS  1st Session 
 H. R. __ 
 IN THE HOUSE OF REPRESENTATIVES 
  
  
  Mr. Steil introduced the following bill; which was referred to the Committee on _______________ 
 
 A BILL 
 To update the definition of an emerging growth company, and for other purposes. 
 
  
  1. Short title This Act may be cited as the   Helping Startups Continue To Grow Act. 
  2. Emerging growth company criteria 
  (a) Securities Act of 1933 Section 2(a)(19) of the Securities Act of 1933 (15 U.S.C. 77b(a)(19)) is amended— 
  (1) by striking  $1,000,000,000 each place such term appears and inserting  $3,000,000,000; 
  (2) in subparagraph (B)— 
  (A) by striking  fifth and inserting  10-year; and 
  (B) by adding  or at the end;  
  (3) in subparagraph (C), by striking  ; or and inserting a period; and 
  (4) by striking subparagraph (D). 
  (b) Securities Exchange Act of 1934 Section 3(a) of the Securities Exchange Act of 1934 (15 U.S.C. 78c(a)) is amended, in the first paragraph (80)— 
  (1) by striking  $1,000,000,000 each place such term appears and inserting  $3,000,000,000; 
  (2) in subparagraph (B)— 
  (A) by striking  fifth and inserting  10-year; and 
  (B) by adding  or at the end;  
  (3) in subparagraph (C), by striking  ; or and inserting a period; and 
  (4) by striking subparagraph (D). 
 


